

**2018 Water Treatment Plant Chemical Bid Tabulation  
Hardin County Water District No. 2  
Bid Number 2018 - 003**

bid opening date 2/9/2018

Item#	Item Description	Bidders												
		Jacobi Carbons	Thatcher Chemical	USAlco	Shannon Chemical	Kemira	JCI Jones	Chemtrade	Sterling Water	Prominent	Univar	American Carbon	Chemical Resources	Brenntag
1	Potassium Permanganate 330# drums	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$2.370*	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$3.560	no bid	no bid	\$3.060
2	Potassium Permanganate 55# buckets	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$2.370*	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$3.770	no bid	no bid	\$3.110
3	Hydrofluosilicic Acid -Bulk	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.457	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.160	no bid	\$0.1925	\$0.189
4	Hydrofluosilicic Acid -drums	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.457	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.2633	no bid	\$0.260	\$0.249
5	Chlorine	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.2105	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.198
6	Powdered Activated Carbon - bulk bags	\$0.525	\$0.820	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.640	no bid	\$0.660	\$0.730	\$0.600
7	Powdered Activated Carbon - 40-55lb bags	\$0.525	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.690	no bid	\$0.760	\$0.800	\$0.620
8	Polyaluminum Chloride	no bid	no bid	\$0.150	no bid	\$0.215	no bid	\$0.124	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.220
9	Sodium Hydroxide - 25%	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.1055	no bid	\$0.107	\$0.097
10	Liquid Ammonium Sulfate (LAS) 40%	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.162	\$0.2972	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.260	\$0.260

Yellow highlight indicates low bid for that product

\* Product does not meet bid specifications